ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

(205) 325-5381

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR ROAD MILLING SERVICES
BID #93R-18 “"ROAD MILLING SERVICES"

JEFFERSON COUNTY JS;EE::YO_N
UNIT PRICE BY SQUARD DUNN
PAY ITEM DESCRIPTION YARD N SOCTIoN JAMESCI:)AVING

408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 45.00 | $ 5.00
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 13.00 | $ 7.50
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 4.00 | $ 1.80
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 4.00 | $ 1.55
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 45.00 | $ 8.50
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 13.00 | $ 8.50
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 6.00 | $ 1.70
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 5.00 | ¢ 1.70
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 45.00 | $ 8.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 26.00 | $ 8.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 9.00 | ¢ 3.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 6.00 | $ 1.80
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 45.00 | $ 9.50
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 26.00 ] $ 9.50
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 11.00 | $ 1.90
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 7.00 | $ 1.80
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00 | $ 9.50
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 32.00 ] $ 9.50
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 11.00 | $ 2.90
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 6.50 | $ 2.00
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00]$ 10.50
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 32.00]$ 10.50
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 13.00 | $ 2.10
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 8.00 | ¢ 1.95
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00] $ 10.50
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00]$ 10.50
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 15.00 | $ 2.10
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 9.00 | $ 1.95
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00]$ 11.50
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00] $ 11.50
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 17.50 | $ 2.30
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 11.00 | $ 2.15
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 64.00]¢$ 11.80
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 53.50|$ 11.80
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 19.50 | $ 2.40
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 12.00] $ 2.21
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 64.00]1$ 11.80
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 53.50|$ 11.80
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 21.50] ¢ 2.40
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 13.00 | $ 2.21
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 83.50|¢$ 11.80
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 62.00]$ 11.80
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 25.00] ¢ 2.40
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 14.00 | $ 2.11
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 83.50|$ 11.80
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 73.00]$ 11.80
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 27.00] ¢ 2.40




408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 15.00 | $ 2.25
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 83.50|$ 12.00
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 71.00]$ 12.00
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 28.00 | $ 2.40
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 16.00 | $ 2.25
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 83.50|$ 10.50
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 60.00] $ 10.50
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sgq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 21.50] ¢ 2.30
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 13.00 | $ 2.20
TOTAL PER REGION| $ 1,783.50 | S 349.63
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS DUNN CONSTRUCTION CO. JAMES PAVING CO.
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES
Statement of Compliance YES YES
Signature Page YES YES
Price Sheet YES YES
PACA Required Forms YES YES
Experience Statement YES YES
Addendum 1 YES YES
Bid Bond/Performance Bond NO YES
CONTACT INFORMATION
JAMES PAVING CO. 2105 Old Montgomery Hwy Pelham, AL 35124 | LARRY JAMES P:205 - 283 -4818; 205-396-1924 E: LARRY @JAMESPAV
DUNN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 3905 Messer Airport Highway Birmingam , AL 35222 | EVANS DUNN P: 205 - 592 - 3866 F: 205- 599-1717 OR 205-592-4




CHILTON

covenmon] o0 | R, | oo | e | somcoury [CHTGLENTY] counry Jcounty oumw] countr- | couwy -
CONSTRUCTION JAMESC Z‘.WING CONSTRUCTION PAVING CONSTRUCTION |PAMESPAVING CO.| o\ o0 ~rton | JAMES PAVING |consTRUCTION JAMES DUNN
[ols) PAVING €O. | concrpucTIO
$ 45.00 |3 5.00 NO BID $ 5.00 NO BID $ 5.00 NO BID $ 5.00 NO BID $ 5.00 NO BID
$ 13.00 | $ 7.50 NO BID $ 7.50 NO BID $ 7.50 NO BID $ 7.50 NO BID $ 7.50 NO BID
$ 4.00 | $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID
$ 4.00 | $ 1.55 NO BID $ 1.55 NO BID $ 1.55 NO BID $ 1.55 NO BID $ 1.55 NO BID
8.5

$ 45.00 | $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID
$ 13.00 | $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID
$ 6.00 | $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID
$ 5.00 | $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID
$ 45.00 | $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID
$  26.00 |$ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID
$ 9.00 | $ 3.50 NO BID $ 3.50 NO BID $ 3.50 NO BID $ 3.50 NO BID $ 3.50 NO BID
$ 6.00 | $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID
$ 45.00 | $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID
$ 26.00 |3 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID
$ 11.00 | $ 1.90 NO BID $ 1.90 NO BID $ 1.90 NO BID $ 1.90 NO BID $ 1.90 NO BID
$ 7.00 1 $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID
$ 43.00 |3 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID
$ 32.00 | $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID
$ 11.00 | ¢ 2.90 NO BID $ 2.90 NO BID $ 2.90 NO BID $ 2.90 NO BID $ 2.90 NO BID
$ 6.50 | $ 2.00 NO BID $ 2.00 NO BID $ 2.00 NO BID $ 2.00 NO BID $ 2.00 NO BID
$ 43.00 | $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID
$ 3200 ]$ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID
$ 13.00 | $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID
$ 8.00 | $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID
$ 43.00 | $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID
$ 43.00 | $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID
$ 15.00 | $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID
$ 9.00 | $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID
$ 43.00 | $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID
$ 43.00]$ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID
$ 17.50 | $ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID
$ 11.00 | $ 2.15 NO BID $ 2.15 NO BID $ 2.15 NO BID $ 2.15 NO BID $ 2.15 NO BID
$ 6400 |$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID
$ 53.50 | $§ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID
$ 19.50 | $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID
$ 12.00 | $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID
$ 64.00 | $§ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID
$ 5350 |$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID
$ 21.50 | $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID
$ 13.00 | $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID
$ 8350 ]$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID
$ 62.00 | $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID
$ 25.00 | ¢ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID
$ 14.00 | $ 2.11 NO BID $ 2.11 NO BID $ 2.11 NO BID $ 2.11 NO BID $ 2.11 NO BID
$ 83.50 | $§ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID
$ 73.00]|$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID
$ 27.00 | $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID




$ 15.00 | $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID
$ 8350 |$ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID
$ 71.00|$ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID
$ 28.00 |$ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID
$ 16.00 | $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID
$ 8350 |$ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID
$ 60.00 |$ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID
$ 2150 |3 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID
$ 13.00 | ¢ 2.20 NO BID $ 2.20 NO BID $ 2.20 NO BID $ 2.20 NO BID $ 2.20 NO BID
$ 1,783.50 | $ 349.63 $ 349.63 $ 349.63 $ 349.63 = $  349.63 =
'INGCOMPANY.COM

632 E: EDUNN@DUNNCONSTRUCTION.COM




BLOUNT BLOUNT ST. CLAIR ST. CLAIR PICKENS PICKENS
COUNTY - |COUNTY - DUNN| COUNTY - COUNTY -  |COUNTY - JAMES| COUNTY - COUNTY -
JAMES CONSTUCTION | JAMES PAVING DUNN PAVING CO. | DUNN CONST.| JAMES

| PAVING €O co. CONSTRUCTIO co
$  5.00 NOBID |$ 5.00 NO BID $ 5.00 NOBID |$ 5.00
$ 7.50 NO BID $ 7.50 NO BID $ 7.50 NO BID $ 7.50
$ 1.80 NOBID |$ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NOBID |$ 1.80
$ 1.55 NO BID $ 1.55 NO BID $ 1.55 NO BID $ 1.55
$ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50
$  8.50 NOBID |$ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NOBID |$ 8.50
$ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70
$ 1.70 NOBID |$ 1.70 NO BID $ 1.70 NOBID |$ 1.70
$  8.50 NOBID |$ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NOBID |$ 8.50
$ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50 NO BID $ 8.50
$  3.50 NOBID |$ 3.50 NO BID $ 3.50 NOBID |$ 3.50
$ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80
$ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50
$  9.50 NOBID |$ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NOBID |$ 9.50
$ 1.90 NO BID $ 1.90 NO BID $ 1.90 NO BID $ 1.90
$ 1.80 NOBID |$ 1.80 NO BID $ 1.80 NOBID |$ 1.80
$  9.50 NOBID |$ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NOBID |$ 9.50
$ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50 NO BID $ 9.50
$ 290 NOBID |$ 2.90 NO BID $ 2.90 NOBID |$ 2.90
$  2.00 NOBID |$ 2.00 NO BID $ 2.00 NOBID |$ 2.00
$ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50
$  10.50 NOBID |$ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NOBID |$ 10.50
$ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10
$ 1.95 NOBID |$ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NOBID |$ 1.95
$  10.50 NOBID |$ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NOBID |$ 10.50
$ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50
$  2.10 NOBID |$ 2.10 NO BID $ 2.10 NOBID |$ 2.10
$ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95 NO BID $ 1.95
$ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50
$ 1150 NOBID |$ 11.50 NO BID $ 11.50 NOBID |$ 11.50
$  2.30 NOBID |$ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NOBID |$ 2.30
$ 215 NOBID |$ 2.15 NO BID $ 2.15 NOBID |$ 215
$ 11.80 NOBID |$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NOBID |$ 11.80
$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80
$ 240 NOBID |$ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NOBID |$ 2.40
$ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21
$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80
$ 11.80 NOBID |$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NOBID |$ 11.80
$ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40
$ 221 NOBID |$ 2.21 NO BID $ 2.21 NOBID |$ 221
$ 11.80 NOBID |$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NOBID |$ 11.80
$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80
$ 240 NOBID |$ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NOBID |$ 2.40
$ 2.11 NO BID $ 2.11 NO BID $ 2.11 NO BID $ 2.11
$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80
$ 11.80 NOBID |$ 11.80 NO BID $ 11.80 NOBID |$ 11.80
$ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40




I $ 225 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NOBID |$ 225
$  12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NOBID |$ 12.00
$ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NO BID $ 12.00 NOBID |$ 12.00
$ 240 NO BID $ 2.40 NO BID $ 2.40 NOBID |$ 240
$ 225 NO BID $ 2.25 NO BID $ 2.25 NOBID |$ 225
$ _10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NOBID |$ 10.50
$  10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NO BID $ 10.50 NOBID |$ 10.50
$ 230 NO BID $ 2.30 NO BID $ 2.30 NOBID |$ 230
$ 220 NO BID $ 2.20 NO BID $ 2.20 NOBID |$ 220
$ 349.63 = $  349.63 = $ 349.63 = $ 349.63




ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

(205) 325-5381

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR ROAD MILLING SERVICES
BID #93R-18 "ROAD MILLING SERVICES"

UNIT
PRICE BY
PAY ITEM
DESCRIPTION SQUARD

YARD
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yyd
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yyd
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd




408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yyd
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yyd
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yyd
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd

TOTAL PER REGION




JEFFERSON COUNTY - DUNN

JEFFERSON

COUNTY - JAMES

CONSTRUCTION PAVING CO.
g 45.00 | $ 5.00
$ 13.00 | $ LA
: 4.00 | $ 1.80
: 2.00 | 5 1.55
: 45.00 | $ §.50
: 13.00 | $ 8.50
: 6.00 | $ .
: 5.00 | § 1.70
. 45.00 | $ 8.50
: 26.00 | $ 8.50
: 9.00 | $ 3.50
: 6.00 | $ 1.50
: 45.00 | $ 2.30
: 26.00 | $ 9.50
$ 11.00 | $ 1.20
: 7.00 | $ 1.80
: 43.00 | $ 9.50
$ 32.00 | $ 2.30
: 11.00 | $ 2.90
: 650 | $ 2.00
: 43.00 | $ 10.50
: 32.00 | $ 10.50
: 13.00 | $ LA
: 8.00 | $ 1.95
43.00 | 5 10.50
: 43.00 | $ 10.50




$ 15.00 | $ 2.10
$ 9.00 | $ 1.95
$ 43.00 | $ 11.50
$ 43.00 | $ 11.50
$ 17.50 | $ 2.30
$ 11.00 [ $ 2.15
$ 64.00 | $ 11.80
$ 53.50 | $ 11.80
$ 19.50 [ $ 2.40
$ 12.00 | $ 2.21
$ 64.00 | $ 11.80
$ 53.50 | $ 11.80
$ 21.50 | $ 2.40
$ 13.00 [ $ 2.21
$ 83.50 | $ 11.80
$ 62.00 | $ 11.80
$ 25.00 | $ 2.40
$ 14.00 | $ 2.11
$ 83.50 | $ 11.80
$ 73.00 | $ 11.80
$ 27.00 | $ 2.40
$ 15.00 | $ 2.25
$ 83.50 | $ 12.00
$ 71.00 | 12.00
$ 28.00 | $ 2.40
$ 16.00 | $ 2.25
$ 83.50 | $ 10.50
$ 60.00 | $ 10.50
$ 21.50 | $ 2.30
$ 13.00 [ $ 2.20
3 1,783.50 | 349.63




ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

(205) 325-5381

) TABULATION SHEET FOR ROAD MILLING SERVICES
BID #93R-18 "ROAD MILLING SERVICES"

UNIT PRICE BY SQUARD SHELB;U(::):NTY - SHELBY COUNTY -
JAMES PAVING CO.
PAY ITEM DESCRIPTION YARD CONSTRUCTION
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 45.00 | $ 5.00
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 13.00 | $ 7.50
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 4.00 | $ 1.80
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 4.00 | $ 1.55
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 45.00 | $ 8.50
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 13.00 | $ 8.50
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 6.00 | $ 1.70
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 5.00 | $ 1.70
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 45.00 | $ 8.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 26.00 | $ 8.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 9.00 | $ 3.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 6.00 | $ 1.80
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 45.00 | $ 9.50
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 26.00 | $ 9.50
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 11.00 | $ 1.90
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 7.00 | $ 1.80
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00 | $ 9.50
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 32.00 | $ 9.50
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 11.00 | $ 2.90
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 6.50 | $ 2.00
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 43.00 | $ 10.50
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 32.00 | $ 10.50
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 13.00 | $ 2.10
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 8.00 | $ 1.95
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00 | $ 10.50
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 43.00 | $ 10.50
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 15.00 | $ 2.10
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 9.00 | $ 1.95
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 43.00 | $ 11.50
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 43.00 | $ 11.50
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 17.50 | $ 2.30
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 11.00 | $ 2.15
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 64.00 | $ 11.80
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 53.50 | $ 11.80
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 19.50 | $ 2.40
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 12.00 | $ 2.21
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 64.00 | $ 11.80
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 53.50 | $ 11.80
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 21.50 | $ 2.40
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 13.00 | $ 2.21
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 83.50 | $ 11.80
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 62.00 | $ 11.80
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 25.00 | $ 2.40
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 14.00 | $ 2.11
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 83.50 | $ 11.80
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 73.00 | $ 11.80
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 27.00 | $ 2.40
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 15.00 | $ 2.25
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 83.50 | $ 12.00
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 71.00 | $ 12.00
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 28.00 | $ 2.40
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 16.00 | $ 2.25
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 83.50 | $ 10.50
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 60.00 | $ 10.50
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.vd $ 21.50 | $ 2.30
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd $ 13.00 | $ 2.20
TOTAL PER REGION| $ 1,783.50 | $ 349.63




ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER
(205) 325-5381
BID TABULATION SHEET FOR ROAD MILLING SERVICES
BID #93R-18 "ROAD MILLING SERVICES"
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UNIT

PRICE BY TUSCALOOS

DUNN CON¢
DESCRIPTION SQUARD

YARD

Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sqg.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO




Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
IPIaning Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO

TOTAL PER REGION




A COUNTY -
STRUCTION

TUSCALOOSA
COUNTY - JAMES
PAVING

BID $ 5.00
BID $ 7.50
BID $ 1.80
BID $ 1.55
BID $ 8.50
BID $ 8.50
BID $ 1.70
BID $ 1.70
BID $ 8.50
BID $ 8.50
BID $ 3.50
BID $ 1.80
BID $ 9.50
BID $ 9.50
BID $ 1.90
BID $ 1.80
BID $ 9.50
BID $ 9.50
BID $ 2.90
BID $ 2.00
BID $ 10.50
BID $ 10.50
BID $ 2.10
BID $ 1.95
BID $ 10.50
BID $ 10.50
BID $ 2.10




BID $ 1.95
BID $ 11.50
BID $ 11.50
BID $ 2.30
BID $ 2.15
BID $ 11.80
BID $ 11.80
BID $ 2.40
BID $ 2.21
BID $ 11.80
BID $ 11.80
BID $ 2.40
BID $ 2.21
BID $ 11.80
BID $ 11.80
BID $ 2.40
BID $ 2.11
BID $ 11.80
BID $ 11.80
BID $ 2.40
BID $ 2.25
BID $ 12.00
BID $ 12.00
BID $ 2.40
BID $ 2.25
BID $ 10.50
BID $ 10.50
BID $ 2.30
BID $ 2.20

-1 349.63




ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER
(205) 325-5381

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR ROAD MILLING SERVICES
BID #93R-18 "ROAD MILLING SERVICES"

PAY ITEM

408A051

408A051

408A051

408A051

408A052

408A052

408A052

408A052

408A053

408A053

408A053

408A053

408A054

408A054

408A054

408A054

408A055

408A055

408A055

408A055

408A056

408A056

408A056

408A056

408A057

408A057

408A057

408A057




408A058

408A058

408A058

408A058

408A059

408A059

408A059

408A059

408A060

408A060

408A060

408A060

408A061

408A061

408A061

408A061

408A062

408A062

408A062

408A062

408A063

408A063

408A063

408A063

408A075

408A075

408A075

408A075




BIBB COUNTY -

DUNN
CONSTRUCTION
S—— ONTPRICE Y

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sqg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sqg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sqg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID

Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.)

Sq.Yd




NO BID

Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sqg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sqg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sqg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd

NO BID
IPIaning Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sqg.Yd NO BID
Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID

Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.

10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.)

Sq.Yd




BIBB COUNTY -
JAMES PAVING CO.
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ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

(205) 325-5381

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR ROAD MILLING SERVICES
BID #93R-18 ""ROAD MILLING SERVICES"

UNIT PRICE
PAY ITEM DESCRIPTION BY SQUARD

YARD
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd




408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yvd
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sqg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd




[CHILTON COUNTY CHILTON
DUNN COUNTY -
|_CONSTRUCTION |} JAMES PAVING |

NO BID $ 5.00
NO BID $ 7.50
NO BID $ 1.80
NO BID $ 1.55
NO BID $ 8.50
NO BID $ 8.50
NO BID $ 1.70
NO BID $ 1.70
NO BID $ 8.50
NO BID $ 8.50
NO BID $ 3.50
NO BID $ 1.80
NO BID $ 9.50
NO BID $ 9.50
NO BID $ 1.90
NO BID $ 1.80
NO BID $ 9.50
NO BID $ 9.50
NO BID $ 2.90
NO BID $ 2.00
NO BID $ 10.50
NO BID $ 10.50
NO BID $ 2.10
NO BID $ 1.95
NO BID $ 10.50
NO BID $ 10.50
NO BID $ 2.10
NO BID $ 1.95




NO BID $ 11.50
NO BID $ 11.50
NO BID $ 2.30
NO BID $ 2.15
NO BID $ 11.80
NO BID $ 11.80
NO BID $ 2.40
NO BID $ 2.21
NO BID $ 11.80
NO BID $ 11.80
NO BID $ 2.40
NO BID $ 2.21
NO BID $ 11.80
NO BID $ 11.80
NO BID $ 2.40
NO BID $ 2.11
NO BID $ 11.80
NO BID $ 11.80
NO BID $ 2.40
NO BID $ 2.25
NO BID $ 12.00
NO BID $ 12.00
NO BID $ 2.40
NO BID $ 2.25
NO BID $ 10.50
NO BID $ 10.50
NO BID $ 2.30
NO BID $ 2.20

- |$s 34963




ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

(205) 325-5381

) TABULATION SHEET FOR ROAD MILLING SERVICES
BID #93R-18 "ROAD MILLING SERVICES"

WINSTON COUNTY ‘(A:,olﬂﬁrTgrf
DUNN
PAY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE BY SQUARD CONSTRUCTION JAMES PAVING
YARD CO.

408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 5.00
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 7.50
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.80
408A051 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 0.00" Thru 1.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.55
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 8.50
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 8.50
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.70
408A052 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 1.10" Thru 2.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.70
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 8.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 8.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 3.50
408A053 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox.2.10" Thru 3.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.80
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 9.50
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 9.50
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.90
408A054 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 3.10" Thru 4.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.80
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 9.50
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 9.50
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.90
408A055 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 4.10" Thru 5.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.00
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 10.50
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 10.50
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.10
408A056 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 5.10" Thru 6.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.95
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 10.50
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 10.50
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.10
408A057 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 6.10" Thru 7.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 1.95
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.50
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.50
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.30
408A058 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 7.10" Thru 8.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.15
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.80
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0 Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.80
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.40
408A059 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 8.10" Thru 9.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.21
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.80
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.80
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.40
408A060 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 9.10" Thru 10.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.21
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.80
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.80
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.40
408A061 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 11.10" Thru 12.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.11
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.80
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 11.80
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.40
408A062 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 12.10" Thru 13.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.25
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 12.00
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 12.00
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.40
408A063 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 13.10" Thru 14.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.25
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (< 1,000 Sg. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 10.50
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (1,000 - 5,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 10.50
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.30
408A075 Planing Existing Pavement (Aprox. 10.10" Thru 11.0" Thick) (> 10,000 Sq. Yd.) Sq.Yd NO BID $ 2.20
TOTAL PER REGION| $ - $ 349.63




